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AMENDMENT NO.4 Dated 06.04.2019 

 
Ref No: HLL/SD/RBD/2018-19/TENDER/11 Dt: 14.03.2019 
 
Title: Supply of Pharmaceutical Products for onward supplies to foreign countries   
 
 
The following amendment has been incorporated to the bid document for the above 
tender;  
 
1. In Notice Inviting Tender – Clause II: Details of Tender (Page No. 4) 

 
FOR 

 
Point No.4   

 
All the Dry Powder and Liquid Injectables are to be manufactured as per USP standards.  

 
MAY BE READ US 

 
 

All the Dry Powder and Liquid Injectables are to be manufactured as per USP/BP/EP 
standards.  

 

2. In General Instruction to Bidders (GIB) – Point No.14: Shelf Life (Page No.11) 

 
FOR 

 
The supplies of all products should be from fresh stock only. At the time of receipt of 
medicines, they should have the latest manufacturing date with minimum 70% of the 
shelf life remaining. Products to be supplied should be of standard quality/quantity as 
per IP/BP/USP/NFI or equivalent specification and must be as per the 
formulations/standard approved/specified by the Drug Control Act and Food & Drug 
Control Administration Regulation or as per the regulation of any such statutory 
authorities. All the Dry Powder and Liquid Injectables are to be manufactured as per 
USP standards. 
 
MAY BE READ US 
 

The supplies of all products should be from fresh stock only. At the time of receipt of 
medicines, they should have the latest manufacturing date with minimum 70% of the 
shelf life remaining. Products to be supplied should be of standard quality/quantity as 
per USP/BP/EP and must be as per the formulations/standard approved/specified by 
the Drug Control Act and Food & Drug Control Administration Regulation or as per 
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the regulation of any such statutory authorities. All the Dry Powder and Liquid 
Injectables are to be manufactured as per USP/BP/EP standards. 

 
3. Last date of sale, submission of bids 

FOR 

Last date for sale of bidding Document: 10.04.2019, 11.30 hrs 

Last date and time for Receipt of bids: 10.04.2019, 14.30 hrs 

MAY BE READ AS 

Last date for sale of bidding Document: 17.04.2019, 11.30 hrs 

Last date and time for Receipt of bids: 17.04.2019, 14.30 hrs 

 

4. Date of Bid opening 

FOR 

Time and date of opening of bids: 10.04.2019, 15.30 hrs 

MAY BE READ AS 

Time and date of opening of bids: 17.04.2019, 15.30 hrs 

 
 
All relevant clauses of the tender document are to be read in accordance with the above 
change and documents to be submitted are to be in compliance of the above. All other 
specifications, terms and conditions of the original tender document shall remain 
unchanged.  
 
 
 
Senior Manager 
Sourcing Division - RBD 
HLL Lifecare Ltd. 
HLL Bhavan, Poojappura, 
Thiruvananthapuram. 
Ph.no: 0471 2353932. 


