
Item No Name of Equipment Name of Bidder
Commercial 

Responsiveness

Resaon For 

Commercial Non 

Responsiveness

Technical 

Responsiveness
Resaon For Technical Non Responsiveness

Overall 

Responsiveness

Ruby International Traders Responsive Responsive Responsive

S.S.Medical Systems (I) Pvt. 

Ltd.

Responsive Non Responsive Technically non-responsive in 

Item no. 1  (Servo Control Open care system on trolley with 

drawers, with radiant warmer, O2-provision) ;  Offering acrylic 

sheet in place of Polycarbonate & offering ceramic heating 

element in place of Quartz heating element.

Non Responsive

Manchanda Medicos Responsive Non Responsive Technically non-responsive in 

Item no. 3 (Resuscitator, hand-operated, neonate, 500ml; 250ml) 

;

No Data sheet submitted & not submitted valid certificate.

Item no. 4 (Laryngoscope set, neonate Straight Blade) : 

Supporting documents (catalogue) not submitted even after 

clarification.

Item no. 6 (Pump, suction, foot-operated) : Very high flow aprox 

30L/min in place of 8-10 L/M

Item no. 7 (Monitor, vital sign, NIBP, HR, SpO2, ECG, RR, Temp) : 

Clarification not submitted.

Item no. 8 (Infantometer, plexi, 3½ft/105cm) : For both models 

Clarification not submitted.

Item no. 9 (Oxygen hood, S and M, including connecting tubes) : 

Supporting documents  not submitted, even after clarification.

Item no. 17 (Transport incubator, basic, with battery and O2, w/o 

ventilator) : For both models Clarification regarding double wall 

transparent canopy with mattress does not meet the desired 

specification.

Non Responsive

Manchanda Medicos Responsive Responsive Responsive

Ruby International Traders Responsive Responsive Responsive

Ruby International Traders Responsive Responsive Responsive

AOV International Responsive Responsive Responsive

Ruby International Traders Responsive Responsive Responsive

AOV International Non Responsive Not complied as per 

Section IX 

Qualification Criteria 

(A) in TED.

Non Responsive Supporting documents not submitted even after clarification. Non Responsive

Manchanda Medicos Responsive Responsive Responsive

2.2,2.4,2.6

Techno Commercial Responsiveness & Non Responsiveness Bidders for Tender Reference No-HLL/PCD/SAARC-02/12-13 

1.1, 1.3,1.5 Kit A1,Kit B1,Kit C1 

For Afghanistan

1.2,1.4,1.6 Kit A2,Kit B2,Kit C2 

For Afghanistan

2.1,2.3,2.5 Kit A1,Kit B1,Kit C1 

For Bangladesh

Kit A2,Kit B2,Kit C2 

For Bangladesh



Plasti Surge Industries Pvt. 

Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Ruby International Traders Responsive Responsive Responsive

AOV International Responsive Responsive Responsive

Manchanda Medicos Responsive Non Responsive Technically non-responsive in 

Item no. 3 (Resuscitator, hand-operated, neonate, 500ml; 250ml) 

;

No Data sheet submitted & not submitted valid certificate.

Item no. 4 (Laryngoscope set, neonate Straight Blade) : 

Supporting documents (catalogue) not submitted even after 

clarification.

Item no. 6 (Pump, suction, foot-operated) : Very high flow aprox 

30L/min in place of 8-10 L/M

Item no. 7 (Monitor, vital sign, NIBP, HR, SpO2, ECG, RR, Temp) : 

Clarification not submitted.

Item no. 8 (Infantometer, plexi, 3½ft/105cm) : For both models 

Clarification not submitted.

Item no. 9 (Oxygen hood, S and M, including connecting tubes) : 

Supporting documents  not submitted, even after clarification.

Item no. 17 (Transport incubator, basic, with battery and O2, w/o 

ventilator) : For both models Clarification regarding double wall 

transparent canopy with mattress does not meet the desired 

specification.

Non Responsive

S.S.Medical Systems (I) Pvt. 

Ltd.

Responsive Non Responsive Technically non-responsive in 

Item no. 1  (Servo Control Open care system on trolley with 

drawers, with radiant warmer, O2-provision) ;  Offering acrylic 

sheet in place of Polycarbonate & offering ceramic heating 

element in place of Quartz heating element.

Non Responsive

Ruby International Traders Responsive Responsive Responsive

AOV International Non Responsive Not complied as per 

Section IX 

Qualification Criteria 

(A) in TED.

Non Responsive Supporting documents not submitted even after clarification. Non Responsive

Manchanda Medicos Responsive Responsive Responsive

Plasti Surge Industries Pvt. 

Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Ruby International Traders Responsive Responsive Responsive

2.2,2.4,2.6

3.1,3.3,3.5

Kit A2,Kit B2,Kit C2 

For Bangladesh

4.1, 4.3,4.5 Kit A1,Kit B1,Kit C1 

For Pakistan

Kit A1,Kit B1,Kit C1 

For Nepal

3.2,3.4,3.6 Kit A2,Kit B2,Kit C2 

For Nepal



Manchanda Medicos Responsive Non Responsive Technically non-responsive in 

Item no. 3 (Resuscitator, hand-operated, neonate, 500ml; 250ml) 

;

No Data sheet submitted & not submitted valid certificate.

Item no. 4 (Laryngoscope set, neonate Straight Blade) : 

Supporting documents (catalogue) not submitted even after 

clarification.

Item no. 6 (Pump, suction, foot-operated) : Very high flow aprox 

30L/min in place of 8-10 L/M

Item no. 7 (Monitor, vital sign, NIBP, HR, SpO2, ECG, RR, Temp) : 

Clarification not submitted.

Item no. 8 (Infantometer, plexi, 3½ft/105cm) : For both models 

Clarification not submitted.

Item no. 9 (Oxygen hood, S and M, including connecting tubes) : 

Supporting documents  not submitted, even after clarification.

Item no. 17 (Transport incubator, basic, with battery and O2, w/o 

ventilator) : For both models Clarification regarding double wall 

transparent canopy with mattress does not meet the desired 

specification.

Non Responsive

Ruby International Traders Responsive Responsive Responsive

Manchanda Medicos Responsive Responsive Responsive

Manchanda Medicos Responsive Responsive Responsive

Plasti Surge Industries Pvt. 

Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Ruby International Traders Responsive Responsive Responsive

Manchanda Medicos Responsive Responsive Responsive

Ruby International Traders Responsive Responsive Responsive

Manchanda Medicos Responsive Responsive Responsive

Ruby International Traders Responsive Responsive Responsive

Plasti Surge Industries Pvt. 

Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

4.2,4.4,4.6 Kit A2,Kit B2,Kit C2 

For Pakistan

5.0,5.1,5.2 Kit A2,Kit B2,Kit C2 

For Bhutan

6.0,6.1 Kit B2,Kit C2 

For Maldives

7.0,7.1,7.2 Kit A2,Kit B2,Kit C2 

For Sri Lanka

4.1, 4.3,4.5 Kit A1,Kit B1,Kit C1 

For Pakistan



Item No Name of Equipment Name of Bidder
Commercial 

Responsiveness

Resaon For 

Commercial Non 

Responsiveness

Technical 

Responsiveness
Resaon For Technical Non Responsiveness

Overall 

Responsiveness

1 Restrainer for rabbit 

Foss India Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Spectra Agritech Responsive Non Responsive Built in recovery test facility using standard 

reference materials is not available.

Non Responsive

Pelican Equipment Responsive Responsive Responsive

Rattan Sales Corporation Responsive Non Responsive Demonstration not arranged for quoted 

model.

Non Responsive

Thermo Fisher Scientific 

India Pvt. Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Yorco Sales Pvt. Ltd. Non Responsive Qualification criteria 

not fulfilled as per 

Tender requirement.

Non Responsive 1.Dimension (External) is not mentioned.

2.Layout is horizontal instead of vertical.

Non Responsive

S.M. Scientific Instruments 

Pvt Ltd.

Responsive Non Responsive 1. Manual defrost facility not available.

2.Door lock not available.

3. Temperature accuracy ± 2°C is not 

available.

4. Operating temperature -30 °C instead of -

20°C.

5.  Icon-based controls and displays not as 

per requirements.

6. Audible/visual warnings for power failure 

not available.

7. Ring back not available.

8. Battery backup: for alarm not available.

9. Remote alarm contacts not available.

10. Refrigeration System : Manual defrost for 

maximum temperature uniformity 

performance not demonstrated.

11. Construction : Door self-closes against 

closed-cell peripheral gasket not available.

Non Responsive

Spinco Biotech Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Non Responsive For auto sampler design ,they are providing 

separate wash solution bottle instead of 

active needle wash .

Non Responsive

Waters(India ) Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Agilent Technologies India 

Pvt. Ltd.

Responsive Non Responsive 1. Providing external needle wash  instead of 

active needle wash.

2.Instead of online degasser standard 

degasser is available,which is not the 

requirement.

Non Responsive

3 Minus 20deg. Freezer for 

molecular Biology Enzyme 

Storage

4 HPLC System

Techno Commercial Responsiveness & Non Responsiveness Bidders for Tender Reference No- HLL/PCD/NIB-13/13-14

No Bid Received

2 Automated Digester & 

Nitrogen analyser



CL Micromed Pvt. Ltd. Non Responsive Qualification criteria 

not fulfilled as per 

Tender requirement.

Non Responsive Sample volume is 200-250 μl instead of  20-

50 μl

Non Responsive

Global Medical System Responsive Responsive Responsive

Thermo Fisher Scientific 

India Pvt. Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Yorco Sales Pvt. Ltd. Non Responsive Qualification criteria 

not fulfilled as per 

Tender requirement.

Non Responsive 1. Temperature uniformity ± 0.3 ˚C @ 37 ˚C 

instead of  < ± 0.2ºC

2. Exterior construction material : 20 

gauge,cold-rolled steel, powder coated 

instead of 18” gauge cold-rolled steel with 

powder coated.

Non Responsive

S.M. Scientific Instruments 

Pvt Ltd.

Non Responsive Qualification criteria 

not fulfilled as per 

Tender requirement.

Non Responsive Catalogue provided is fully copied  specs of 

NIB.

Non Responsive

Thermo Fisher Scientific 

India Pvt. Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Yorco Sales Pvt. Ltd. Non Responsive Qualification criteria 

not fulfilled as per 

Tender requirement.

Non Responsive Temp. range from 10 to 60°C. ± 3 instead of 

Ambient +5°C to 100°C

Non Responsive

S.M. Scientific Instruments 

Pvt Ltd.

Non Responsive Qualification criteria 

not fulfilled as per 

Tender requirement.

Non Responsive Catalogue provided is fully copied  specs of 

NIB.

Non Responsive

8 Inverted  Flourescent 

Microscope with Digital 

Camera

Towa Optics (I) Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

9 HPLC system with PC & 

Windows & Operating 

System & Printer

Waters(India ) Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

7 Enviornmental Room 

(Stability Chamber)(Table 

Top)

5 Osmometer

6 Bench top CO2 Incubator



Item No
Item 

Description
Name of Bidder

Commercial 

Responsiveness

Reason for  Commercial Non 

Responsiveness

Technical 

Responsiveness

Resaon For Technical Non 

Responsiveness

Overall 

Responsiveness

1 HPTLC  Anchrom Enterprises (I) Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Techno Commercial Responsiveness & Non Responsiveness Bidders for Tender Reference No- HLL/PCD/CCRS-01/13-14



Item No Name of Equipment Name of Bidder
Commercial 

Responsiveness

Resaon For 

Commercial Non 

Responsiveness

Technical 

Responsiveness

Resaon For Technical 

Non Responsiveness

Overall 

Responsiveness

1
Automatic Powder dosing 

Instrument for Reference Standards
Mettlet Toledo India Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

2
Automatic Powder dosing 

Instrument for  RS Impurities
Mettlet Toledo India Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Techno Commercial Responsiveness & Non Responsiveness Bidders for Tender Reference No- HLL/PCD/IPC-09/13-14



Item No Item Description Name of Bidder
Commercial 

Responsiveness

Reason for  Commercial 

Non Responsiveness

Technical 

Responsiveness
Resaon For Technical Non Responsiveness

Overall 

Responsiveness

Analytical Technologies Ltd. Non Responsive 1.Submitted conditional 

bid, Warranty given for 2 

years instead of 3 years as 

per Tender requirement.

Non Responsive Major deviation

(i)WORKABLE TEMPERATURE RANGE : 

abmient 5 to 100 deg in place of 5 to 80 

degree C

(ii)Sample Capacity : 60X1.5ml in place of 

100x 2 ml vials

(iii)No Suitable software 21 CFR PART II 

compliance

(iv) Pump - Not gradient delay volume.

Non Responsive

Perkin Elmer (India) Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Thermo Fischer Scientific 

India Pvt.Ltd

Non-Responsive Performance requirement 

as per Q.C. not complied

Non-Responsive (i)Flow range : 0.2 -10.0 ml/min instead of 

0.01 to 10 ml/ min

(ii)Concentration Precision <0.15%SD 

instead of ±0.1%

(iii)Tray Temperature Operating Range  4 - 

45 degree C or 22 degree C below ambient 

instead of 10º C below ambient to 50 º C   

(iv)Temperature Accuracy  ±2 ºC instead of  

±0.5 ºc  

Non-Responsive

Waters (I) Pvt.Ltd. Responsive Non-Responsive (i)WORKABLE TEMPERATURE RANGE is 4 to 

65 deg C  instead of 5 to 80 degree C

(ii)Injection Volume Accuracy is  ±2% 

instead of ±1%

(iii)Tray Temperature Operating Range  4 to 

40 deg programmablein 1 deg C instead of 

10º C below ambient to 50 º C   

(iv)Temperature Accuracy  ±1.0ºC instead 

of  ±0.5 ºc  

Non-Responsive

Agilent Technologies 

singapore(sales)Pte.Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Analytical Technologies Ltd. Non-Responsive 1.Warranty given for 1 

year instead of 3 years as 

per Tender requirement. 

2.Performance 

requirement as per Q.C. 

not complied

Non-Responsive (i)S/N Ratio : 15000:1 instead of 10000:1

(ii)Software feature as per technical 

specifications are not available.

(iii) Details to minimize the effect of 

atmospheric water and CO2 interference 

on the system is not available. 

Non-Responsive

Perkin Elmer (India) Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Thermo Fischer Scientific 

India Pvt.Ltd

Non Responsive Performance requirement 

as per Q.C. not complied

Non Responsive As per the clarification system is not 

monolithic.

Non Responsive

1 Quaternary Gradient 

HPLC

2 Fourier Transform 

Infrared Spectrometer 

(FTIR)

Techno Commercial Responsiveness & Non Responsiveness Bidders for Tender Reference No-HLL/PCD/CDSCO/01/13-14



Toshvin Analytical Pvt.Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Agilent Technologies 

singapore(sales)Pte.Ltd.

Responsive (Model 1 : Cary 660)

 Responsive 

Non-Responsive

(Model 2 : Cary 630)

(i)Spectral resolution : <2 cm-1 instead of 

Resolution: 0.5 cm-1 or better

(ii)Signal to noise ratio : 

30000:1 Open beam,1 min,4cm-1 

resolution

15,000:1 Diamond ATR,1min,4cm-1 

resolution instead of S/N Ratio: 10000:1 

Peak-Peak, 5 Seconds Scan 

Responsive 

(Model: 660)

Analytical Technologies Ltd. Non Responsive 1.Submitted conditional 

bid. 

2.Performance 

requirement as per Q.C. 

not complied. Only 1 qty 

is offered against of 4 as 

per Tender requirement. 

3.Tender validity is 

mentioned as only 30 

days.

Non Responsive (i)Wavelength range for excitation and 

emission : 200-760 nm in place of 200-800

(ii)Wavelength range for Band Width (Slits) 

: 200-760 nm in place of 200-800

(iii)No Suitable software 21 CFR PART II 

compliance

Non Responsive

Perkin Elmer (India) Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Agilent Technologies 

singapore(sales)Pte.Ltd.

Non Responsive Performance not 

complied as per 

qualification criteria of the 

Tender

Responsive Non Responsive

Vitan Medical systems Pvt. 

Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Metrohm India Ltd, Responsive Responsive Responsive

Vitan Medical systems Pvt. 

Ltd.

Responsive Responsive  for 

Model 1: 

TGA/DSC 1- with 

MX1 Balance

Non Responsive for 

Model 2:

 TGA/DSC 1- with  

XP1 Balance

Model 2:

TGA/DSC 1- with XP1 Balance

Temperature Range : Up to 1100°C with 

accuracy of +/- 1°C instead of Up to 1000°C 

with accuracy of +/- 0.5°C

Responsive

Perkin Elmer (India) Pvt.Ltd. Responsive Non Responsive The quoted model TGA-4000 does not have 

std-ring weights as per the received 

clarifications.

Non Responsive

Netjsch Technologies India 

Pvt. Ltd.

Non-Responsive Performance requirement 

as per Q.C. not complied. 

And for PC,Printer & UPS 

100% advance required.

Non Responsive 1. Points under standard ,safety and 

training not complied.

2. Valid FDA/CE/UL/BIS not submitted.

3. ISO 9001 not submitted.

Non Responsive

2 Fourier Transform 

Infrared Spectrometer 

(FTIR)

3 Spectro flourometer 

4 Automatic Karl 

Fischer Titrator 

5 Thermo Gravimetric 

Analyzer 



Perkin Elmer (India) Pvt.Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Vitan Medical systems Pvt. 

Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Netjsch Technologies India 

Pvt. Ltd.

Non Responsive Performance requirement 

as per Q.C. not complied. 

And for PC,Printer & UPS 

100% advance required.

Non Responsive 1. Points under standard ,safety and 

training not complied.

2. Valid FDA/CE/UL/BIS not submitted.

Non Responsive

7 Viscometer with 

Helipath 

Analytical Technologies Ltd. Non Responsive 1.NSIC submitted but the 

bidder has quoted as an 

agent to another 

manufacturer.

2. Offered 1 year 

comprehensive on-site 

warranty instead of 3 year 

required as per tender 

requirement.

3. Price quoted are CIP 

Delhi price

Delivery after receipt of 

payment. 

4. Penalty for late 

shipment is 0.15% per day 

of the price to a maximum 

of 5%.

Non Responsive Injection Volume : selectable between 1-

100 µl in partial mode,fixed 200 µl instead 

of 0.1 to 100 μL

Non Responsive

Techcomp India Pvt.Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Perkin Elmer (India) Pvt.Ltd. Responsive Non Responsive They have not quoted dedicated Amino 

Acid Analyzer

Non Responsive

Waters (I) Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Non Responsive They have not quoted dedicated Amino 

Acid Analyzer

Non Responsive

9 TOC Analyzer Swan Environmental 

Pvt.Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

10 HPTLC Anchrom Enterprises (I) Pvt. 

Ltd

Responsive Responsive Responsive

DSS Imagetech Pvt. Ltd Responsive Responsive Responsive

Radical Instruments Responsive Non Responsive As per the clarification camera software 

and microscope are not from the same 

manufacturer.

Non Responsive

S.M.Scientific Instruments 

Pvt. Ltd.

Non Responsive Performance not 

complied as per 

qualification criteria of the 

Tender

Responsive Non Responsive

6 Differential Scanning 

Calorimeter 

No Bid Received

8 Amino Acid Analyzer 

11 Microscope(Phase 

Contrast) 

12 Lyophilizer 



Rattan sales Corporation Responsive Responsive Responsive

Aimil Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Shreedhar Instruments Non Responsive 1.Performance 

requirement as per Q.C. 

not complied. 

2. Ask computers and 

printers to be provided by 

HLL Lifecare Ltd. Which is 

part of Technical 

Specification

Non Responsive The Quoted model 9703+ is not 21CFR 

compliance and are not provided laser 

printer and computer as per tender 

specification

Non Responsive

Analytical Technologies Ltd. Non Responsive 1.Warranty given for 2 

year instead of 3 years as 

per Tender requirement. 

2. Performance 

requirement as per Q.C. 

not complied

Non Responsive 1. Ebert-fastie optics electronic double 

beam in place of real time double beam, 

2. Grating:1200 line/mm in place of 1800 

lines/mm

Non Responsive

Perkin Elmer (India) Pvt.Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Agilent Technologies 

Singapore (sales) Pte. Ltd

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Thermofisher Scientific 

India Pvt.Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Toshvin Analytical P. Ltd. Responsive Non Responsive Not offered auto dilutor Non Responsive

Analytical Technologies Ltd. Non-Responsive 1.Warranty given for 1 

year instead of 3 years as 

per Tender requirement. 

2. Performance 

requirement as per Q.C. 

not complied

Non-Responsive 1. Monochramator not providing, 

2. Wave length accuracy ± 0.3 in place of ± 

0.1nm, 

3. Stray light -1.2% w/v solution of KCL at 

200nm ≥2Abs not providing

Non-Responsive

Perkin Elmer (India) Pvt.Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Agilent Technologies 

Singapore (sales) Pte. Ltd.

Non-Responsive Performance requirement 

as per Q.C. not complied

Non-Responsive Pre Monochromator in place of 

monochramator -double, Resolution 

0.193nm in place of 0.1nm, spectral 

bandwidth:0.20 - 4.00nm,0.1nm steps in 

place of 0.1,0.2,0.5,1,2,5 nm(6 steps)

Non-Responsive

Toshvin Analytical P. Ltd. Responsive Responsive for 

(Model 1 : UV-2700)

                                   

Non-Responsive

(Model 2 : UV -2600)
Model 2 : Single monochromator in place 

of monochramator-double

Responsive

12 Lyophilizer 

Liquid Particle 

Counter 

14 Atomic Absorption 

Spectrophotometer 

15 UV-Vis-

Spectrophotometer 

13



16 Dissolution Test 

Apparatus 

Electrolab (I) Pvt Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Analytical Technologies Ltd. Non-Responsive 1.Warranty given for 1 

year instead of 3 years as 

per Tender requirement. 

2. Performance 

requirement as per Q.C. 

not complied

Non-Responsive 1. Model 1 (ASGW 3003) : Accuracy ±0.01 

inplace of ±0.005 deg C

2. Model 2 : Accuracy ±0.01 inplace of 

±0.005 deg C

Non-Responsive

Agaram Industries Responsive Responsive Responsive

Anton Paar India Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Analytical Technologies Ltd. Non-Responsive 1.Warranty given for 1 

year instead of 3 years as 

per Tender requirement. 

2. Performance 

requirement as per Q.C. 

not complied

Non-Responsive Incomplete offer, only quoted for PCR, not 

quoted other item

Non-Responsive

Geno Biosciences Pvt. Ltd Responsive Responsive Responsive

Vitan Medical systems Pvt. 

Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Metrohm India Ltd, Responsive Responsive  for 

(Model 1 : 904)

Non-Responsive for 

(Model  2 : 888) Model 2- 888 :  Polarized sensor resolution: 

0.1 mv/0.01 µA in place of 0.1 mv/0.1 µA

Responsive

Analytical Technologies Ltd. Non-Responsive 1.Warranty given for 2 

year instead of 3 years as 

per Tender requirement. 

2.Performance 

requirement as per Q.C. 

not complied

Non-Responsive Wavelength:±0.3nm inplace of ±0.2nm and 

Emission wavelength scanning 220-700nm 

in place of 280 -900 nm

Non-Responsive

Perkin Elmer (India) Pvt.Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Agilent Technologies 

Singapore (sales) Pte. Ltd

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Thermofisher Scientific 

India Pvt.Ltd.

Responsive Non-Responsive Flow 0.2-10.0 ml inplace of 0.01 to 

5ml/min in 0.01 ml/min increment, 4-45 

Deg C or 22 deg. C below ambient in place 

of 10 to 50 Deg C below ambient

Non-Responsive

Spinco Biotech Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Non-Responsive   Repliction injection 1-30 inplace of 1-50, 4-

40 Deg C  in place of 10 below ambient to 

50 Deg C 

Non-Responsive

HPLC gradient system 

with PDA,RI Detector 

17 Digital Polari meter 

18 Thermo 

cycler(Polymerase 

Chain Reaction)-PCR 

19 Autotitrator 

20



Waters (I) Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Non-Responsive  4-40 Deg C  in place of 10 below ambient 

to 50 Deg C 

Non-Responsive

Analytical Technologies Ltd. Non-Responsive 1. Warranty given for 1 

year instead of 3 years as 

per Tender requirement. 

2. Performance 

requirement as per Q.C. 

not complied

Non-Responsive TOC<200=ppb in place of <5 ppb, Only RO 

in place of Two stage system

Non-Responsive

Metrohm India Ltd, Non-Responsive Performance requirement 

as per Q.C. not complied

Responsive Non-Responsive

Millipore (I) Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Non-Responsive Providing 0.22µl in place of 0.20 Non-Responsive

Chromatopak Analytical 

Instrumentation (I) Pvt. Ltd.

Non-Responsive 1.Performance 

requirement as per Q.C. 

not complied.

2. Power of Attorney in 

favour of signatory of TE 

documents is not given.

Non-Responsive Less than 1 per ml in place of Particle using 

0.2 µm filter:less than 20 particle/100ml,

Non-Responsive

Pall India Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Sartorius weighing India 

Pvt.Ltd.

Responsive Non-Responsive Particle content <1/ml in place of 0.2 µl Non-Responsive

22 Profile Projector for 

Tubal Rings 

23 Tensile Testor for 

Copper T and Tubal 

rings 

Ashian Engineers Company 

India

Responsive Responsive Responsive

HPLC gradient system 

with PDA,RI Detector 

21 Water Purification 

System 

No Bid Received

20



Item No
Name of 

Equipment
Name of Bidder

Commercial 

Responsiveness

Resaon For 

Commercial Non 

Responsiveness

Technical 

Responsiveness
Resaon For Technical Non Responsiveness

Overall 

Responsiveness

MDD Medical Systems 

(India) Pvt. Ltd. 

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Linde India Limited (formely 

known as BOC India 

Limited)

Responsive Non Responsive 1.Valid certificate not submitted & model not 

offered for O2 control panel.

2.Valid certificate not submitted & model not 

offered for Oxygen flow meter with Humidifier 

Bottle.

3. Valid certificate not submitted & model not 

offered for N2O control panel.

4. Valid certificate not submitted for Medical air 

plant

5. Datasheet and valid certificate not submitted 

for Medical vacuum plant.

6. Datasheet and valid certificate not submitted 

for Theater vacuum light.

7. AGSS Plastic remote indicator not offered.

8. Valid certificate not submitted for AGSS 

reservoir.

9. AGSS hose assembly not offered.

10. CO2 main manifold not offered.

11. CO2 main manifold not offered. 

12. Model not offered & datasheet not 

submitted for Medical Gas Line Pressure Alarm.

13. Model not offered & datasheet not 

submitted for Master alarm panel.

Non Responsive

Medical Products Services Responsive Responsive Responsive

Invoke Medical Systems (P) 

Ltd.

Non Responsive Manufacturer's 

Authorization Form not 

in TED format

Non Responsive 1.Offered Air plant is not an  Imported one and 

it is of no use for breathibg air applications,

2.Outlet offered with PVC ring in place of metal.

3.Valid certificates not submitted where ever 

asked in technical specification.

Non Responsive

Quality Medical Systems Non Responsive Not meeting the 

required performance 

criteria 

Non Responsive 1. Valid certificate not submitted whereever 

asked in the specs.

2. Complete BOQ not submitted.

Non Responsive

Benson Medical 

Equipments (India) Pvt. Ltd.       

Responsive Non Responsive 1.Valid CE not submitted for AGSS Reservior, 

Theater Vaccum unit, O2 flow meter & 

humidifier bottle and Pressure Reducing Station.

2. Imported outlet probes not offered  for 

O2,N2O,MA4,MA &, Vaccum & AGSS

Non Responsive

Techno Commercial Responsiveness & Non Responsiveness Bidders for Tender Reference No-HLL/PCD/PMSSY-II/03/13-14

1 Medical Gas 

Pipeline System



Item No Name of Equipment Name of Bidder
Commercial 

Responsiveness

Resaon For 

Commercial Non 

Responsiveness

Technical 

Responsiveness

Resaon For Technical Non 

Responsiveness

Overall 

Responsiveness

Rohit Surgical Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Non Responsive 1. IR/ Wireless hand set not available

2. Full length radio translucent area not 

available.

3. CE / USFDA certificate not submitted.

Non Responsive

Steris (India) Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Non Responsive Patient weight bearing capacity 270kg 

instead of min. 300kg

Non Responsive

Indian Surgical 

Equipment Co. Pvt. Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

2 Harmonic Scalpel Aprameya Engineering Responsive Responsive Responsive

Global Life Care Private 

Ltd

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Karl Storz Endoscopy 

India Private Ltd. 

Responsive Non Responsive 1. CE/ FDA for ESU not submitted.

2. Valid ISO certificate not submitted.

Non Responsive

Rohit Surgical Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

4 Laparoscopic instruments for 

bariatiric surgery

Karl Storz Endoscopy 

India Private Ltd. 

Responsive Non Responsive Valid ISO certificate not submitted. Non Responsive

5 Delivery Bed Surgicoin Medequip Pvt. 

Ltd.

Responsive Non Responsive Valid FDA/CE/BIS not submitted. Non Responsive

6 Foetal Monitor with central 

station

Innovative Medicare 

Technologies

Non Responsive No End User 

certificate attached. 

Only PO submitted 

for 18 Nos. against 20 

Nos.

Non Responsive 1. Internal memory to trace upto 1 hour 

data offered instead of 5 hour.

2. Battery back up not available.

Non Responsive

7 Cardiotocography Innovative Medicare 

Technologies

Responsive Non Responsive 1. Internal memory to trace upto 1 hour 

data offered instead of 5 hour.

2. Battery back up not available.

Non Responsive

8 Standard operative and 

diagnostic Hysteroscopy set with 

TCRE with controlled irrigation 

and suction

Karl Storz Endoscopy 

India Private Ltd. 

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Global Life Care Private 

Ltd

Responsive Non Responsive 1. Integrated zoom lens not available.

2. Manual light adjustments not 

available.

Non Responsive

Karl Storz Endoscopy 

India Private Ltd. 

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Techno Commercial Responsiveness & Non Responsiveness Bidders for Tender Reference No-HLL/PCD/PMSSY/PUNJAB/GMCA-03/13-14

1 OT Table

3 General Surgery Laparoscopic Set

9 Endovision Imaging system for 

Laparoscopy



Rohit Surgical Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Non Responsive 1.Optical zoom not available.

2.Integrated zoom and focus lens not 

available.

Non Responsive

10 Electromechanical Morcellator 

and Vessel Sealling system with 

inbuilt Electro Surgical Unit for 

Operating Laparoscopy Surgery

Karl Storz Endoscopy 

India Private Ltd. 

Responsive Non Responsive Specific Model or data sheet of E.S.U 

(Cautery) not submitted.

Non Responsive

11 Vessel Sealing system with 

Electro surgical generator for 

Operating Hysteroscope & LAP

Vishal Surgical 

Equipment Company

Responsive Non Responsive CE/US FDA  certificate not submitted. Non Responsive

12 Endovision Imaging System for 

Hysteroscopy

Karl Storz Endoscopy 

India Private Ltd. 

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Karl Storz Endoscopy 

India Private Ltd. 

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Global Life Care Private 

Ltd

Responsive Non Responsive Instrument sizes not comply with the 

tender specification.

Non Responsive

Arogya International Non Responsive No valid end user 

certificate submitted 

as per Performance 

Criteria laid down in 

the Tender enquiry 

document.

Non Responsive 1. Light head is triangle in shape inplace 

of circular.

2. Sterilizable knob for light adjustment 

not available.

3. Size of light source not adjustable.

Non Responsive

Medi Works Responsive Non Responsive During demonstration it was found : 

Light illumination neither shadow free 

not homogeneous, articulating  arm too 

long, no sterilizable handle, light field 

adjustment-not satisfactory, only light 

intensity increasing or decreasing , light 

intensity at 1 m distance-not satisfactory 

and light field at 70-140 cm - not 

satisfactory.

Non Responsive

Rohit Surgical Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Non Responsive 1. Fixed light field diameter instead of 

adjustable from 22cm to 30cm.

2. Light intensity 55000 lux instead of 

60000lux.

3. LED life 30000 hrs instead of 35000 hrs

4. Valid CE/ FDA not submitted.

Non Responsive

Steris India Pvt. Limited Responsive Non Responsive 1. 50000 lux instead of 60000lux or 

better.

2. Lmp life 30000 hours offered instead 

of 35000 hrs.

3. Valid CE/ FDA not submitted.

Non Responsive

Vishal Surgical 

Equipment Company

Responsive Non Responsive 1. Fixed light field diameter instead of 

adjustable from 22cm to 30cm.

2. Valid CE/ FDA not submitted.

Non Responsive

15 Eye bank Specular Microscope 

(Eye Bank kerato-analyzer)

16 Clinical Endothelial Micrcoscope N W Overseas Responsive Responsive Responsive

17 Chart Projection for Pediatric 

Patients

Item deleted after amendment

13 Laparoscopic Surgery Hand 

Instrument with CO2 Insufflator

14 Mobile Examination Light based 

on LED technology

No Bid Received

9 Endovision Imaging system for 

Laparoscopy



18 Synaptophore

19 Keratometer

20 OCT Machine N W OVERSEAS Responsive Responsive Responsive

21 Cytocentrifuge

Reliance Instruments 

Corporation 

Non Responsive No end user 

certificate submitted 

as desired as per 

Section IX-QC 02(a) of 

TE document.

Responsive Non Responsive

Surgicoin Medequip Pvt. 

Ltd.

Responsive Responsive Responsive

23 Automated Slide Stainers

24 Automatic Microtome

25 Automatic Tissue Processor

26 Dry Heat Water Bath (Heat Block)

27 Paraffin Tissue Embedding Centre Delhi Hospital Supply 

Pvt Ltd.

Non Responsive Performance not 

submitted as per 

Section IX of  TE 

document.

Non Responsive 1. ISO 13485 & ISO 9001 not submitted.

2. IEC 6I010-1 not submitted.

3. FDA/CE/ISI not submitted.

Non Responsive

28 Automated Knife Sharpener

29 Table top Micro-centrifuge

30 Tissue Floatation Bath

31 Automated Electrophoresis 

System with scanner 

/Densitometer

Mex India Non Responsive 1. Manufacturer's 

Authorisation not in 

the name of the 

actual bidder.

2. Performance of the 

bidder is not provided 

as per Section IX of 

TED.

Non Responsive Disposable sample applicator offered 

inplace of Stainless steel

Non Responsive

32 Refrigerated Centrifuge Eppendorf India Limited Non-Responsive Tender form (Section-

X), performance 

statement and end 

user certificates 

(Section-IX) not 

enclosed as desired in 

the tender enquiry.

Resposive Non Responsive

33 Deep Freezer (-20 deg C)

34 PCR Thermocycler) Eppendorf India Limited Non-Responsive Tender form (Section-

X), performance 

statement and end 

user certificates 

(Section-IX) not 

enclosed as desired in 

the tender enquiry.

Non Responsive ISO 13485 and ISO 9001 not submitted. Non Responsive

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

Item deleted after amendment

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

22 Autoclave (Horizontal)

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received



35 Biosafety cabinet

36 Analytical balance

37 Spectrophotometer Agilent Technologies 

India Pvt. Ltd 

Responsive Responsive Responsive

38 Deep Freezer (-80 deg C) Eppendorf India Limited Non-Responsive Tender form (Section-

X), performance 

statement and end 

user certificates 

(Section-IX) not 

enclosed as desired in 

the tender enquiry.

Responsive Non-Responsive

39 HPLC System Agilent Technologies 

India Pvt. Ltd 

Responsive Responsive Responsive

40 Thin layer Chromatography

41 PNCL Set Karl Storz Endoscopy 

India Private Ltd. 

Responsive Non Responsive Offered model sizes/angle deviates from 

tender specification.

Non Responsive

Alan Electronic Systems 

Pvt. Ltd.

Responsive Non Responsive 1. Complete system and accessories are 

not from the same manufacturer.

2. USFDA/CE not submitted.

3. ISO certificate not submitted.

Non Responsive

Covidien Healthcare 

India Pvt. Ltd.

Responsive Non Responsive 1. Intergrated touch screen not evident 

from the documents submitted.

2. Supporting documents not submitted.

Non Responsive

Global Life Care Private 

Ltd

Non-Responsive Relevant end user 

certificates in favour 

of manufacturer and 

agent not submitted.

Non Responsive 1. Intergrated touch screen not evident 

from the documents submitted.

2. Compatible with Argon Plasma 

coagulator not evident.

3. Valid ISO certificate not submitted.

Non Responsive

Rohit Surgical Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Vishal Surgical 

Equipment Company

Responsive Non Responsive 1. Intergrated touch screen not evident 

from the documents submitted.

2. Valid ISO certificate not submitted.

Non Responsive

43 Whole Body combined UV 

therapy unit

44 Hand foot UV phototherapy 

device

45 Multi Application Laser Platform Rohit Surgical Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

42 Electro Surgical Unit (ESU) with 

vessel sealing system

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

1. Helium dilusion method not available.

2. CH4 analyzer instead of Helium 

analyzer.

3. He mixer cylinder not available.

4. IEC-60601-1-2 certificate not 

submitted.

5. Valid CE certificate not submitted.

6. ISO not submitted.

Non ResponsivePFT Machine (advanced)46 Salaxmi Distributors Non-Responsive End user certificate 

not submitted as per 

section-IX of the 

Tender Enquiry.

Non Responsive



47 Video Thoracoscope

48 Computerized dedicated Stress 

Testing machine along with 

treadmill with pace maker 

analysis facility and SAECG

49 Blood Mixer and Collector

50 Walk in Cooler

51 Basic Plastic/ Rhynoplasty /Cleft 

lip & Palate surgery instrument 

set

Rohit Surgical Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

52 PC Based polygraph

53 Paediatric Flexible fiber optic / 

Video Laryngoscope

Karl Storz Endoscopy 

India Private Ltd. 

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Allied Medical Ltd. Responsive Non Responsive 1. Manifold for 3 Vaporizers not offered.

2. 2. Integrated NMT not available.

3. Cardiac output by thermodilution 

method offered instead of cardiac output 

technology.

Non Responsive

Spacelabs Healthcare Responsive Non Responsive 1. 2 Selectatec mount for vaporizers 

offered instead of 3.

2. Integrated NMT not available.

3. Cardiac output by thermodilution 

method offered instead of cardiac output 

technology.

Non Responsive

55 Operating microscope complete 

set for surgery and teaching

Toshbro Medicals Pvt. 

Ltd.

Responsive Non Responsive 1. Tool tracking facility not available.

2. Magnification: 1.4x to 14.5x offered 

instead of 1.8x to 15.8x

Non Responsive

56 Conventional surgical operating 

microscope with zoom 

magnification 5 steps with high 

standard optics

57 BERA with ASSR Medilife Technologies Responsive Responsive Responsive

58 OAE Medilife Technologies Responsive Responsive Responsive

Rohit Surgical Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

54 Anaesthesia Work Station

No Bid Received

59 ENT examination unit with 

motorized patient chair complete 

unit

Item deleted after amendment

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

No Bid Received

Item deleted after amendment

1. Helium dilusion method not available.

2. CH4 analyzer instead of Helium 

analyzer.

3. He mixer cylinder not available.

4. IEC-60601-1-2 certificate not 

submitted.

5. Valid CE certificate not submitted.

6. ISO not submitted.

Non ResponsivePFT Machine (advanced)46 Salaxmi Distributors Non-Responsive End user certificate 

not submitted as per 

section-IX of the 

Tender Enquiry.

Non Responsive



Vishal Surgical 

Equipment Company

Non-Responsive End user certificate 

not submitted as per 

section-IX of the 

Tender Enquiry.

Non Responsive 1. 150W Halogen lamp offered inplace of 

180-300W Xenon lamp.

2.  CE/USFDA not submitted.

Non Responsive

60 General instruments for ENT 

surgery Instruments for ear 

surgery

61 Micro motor drill with hand 

pieces and accessories (2 unit) 

and Micro drill for cochleostomy 

(1 unit)

Rohit Surgical Pvt. Ltd. Non-Responsive Manufacturer 

Authorisation 

Performance 

statement and end 

user certificates not 

enclosed by the 

bidder.

Responsive Non-Responsive

62 Instrument set for micro ear 

surgery

Karl Storz Endoscopy 

India Private Ltd. 

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Rohit Surgical Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Karl Storz Endoscopy 

India Private Ltd. 

Responsive Responsive Responsive

64 CO2 laser Rohit Surgical Pvt. Ltd. Non-Responsive Performance 

statement and end 

user certificates not 

enclosed by the 

bidder.

Responsive Non-Responsive

65 Flexible Rhino Pharyngo Laryngo-

Fiberscope

Karl Storz Endoscopy 

India Private Ltd. 

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Karl Storz Endoscopy 

India Private Ltd. 

Responsive Responsive Responsive

Rohit Surgical Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

67 Rigid esophagoscope Karl Storz Endoscopy 

India Private Ltd. 

Responsive Responsive Responsive

68 Electronystagmographic machine

63 Instrument set for micro 

laryngeal surgery

66 Rigid laryngoscope

No Bid Received

59 ENT examination unit with 

motorized patient chair complete 

unit

No Bid Received



Item No Name of Equipment Name of Bidder
Commercial 

Responsiveness

Resaon For 

Commercial Non 

Responsiveness

Technical 

Responsiveness

Resaon For Technical Non 

Responsiveness

Overall 

Responsiveness

Digital Fundus Camera 

(Non-Mydriatic)

Emco Tech Equipments Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

N.W. Overseas Responsive Responsive Responsive

Biomedix Optotechnik & Devices Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Non Responsive 1. Valid CE or USFDA certificate 

not submitted.

2. Flash energy 19 in place of 

22 flash levels.

Non Responsive

Emco Tech Equipments Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

N.W. Overseas Responsive Responsive Responsive

Biomedix Optotechnik & Devices Pvt. Ltd. Non Responsive Not complies the 

performance criteria

Responsive Non Responsive

3 Anterior Segment Imaging 

System

Emco Tech Equipments Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Emco Tech Equipments Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Harrak International Responsive Responsive Responsive

N.W. Overseas Responsive Responsive Responsive

Biomedix Optotechnik & Devices Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Rohit Surgical Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Emco Tech Equipments Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Harrak International Responsive Responsive Responsive

Emco Tech Equipments Pvt. Ltd. Non Responsive Performance criteria 

not complies for 

Authorized Agent even 

after clarification.

Non-responsive 1. Valid CE or USFDA certificate 

not submitted. 

2. 3D anterior chamber 

analysis not available and 

scheimpflug image not 

available.

Non Responsive

N.W. Overseas Non Responsive Performance criteria 

not complies even 

after clarification 

submitted.

Non-responsive Valid CE or USFDA certificate 

not submitted.

Non-responsive

Emco Tech Equipments Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

5 High End Operative 

Microscope

6 Elevation based Interior 

segment Imaging with 

Scheimpflug technology

7 Corneal Topography

Techno Commercial Responsiveness & Non Responsiveness Bidders for Tender Reference No- HLL/PCD/NCT/01/13-14

1

2 HD Special Domain OCT 

Machine

4 Frequency Doubled 532 

Nm Green Laser, Pattern 

or Multisport



Harrak International Non Responsive Performance criteria 

not complies even 

after clarification 

asked for.

Responsive Non Responsive

N.W. Overseas Responsive Non Responsive Valid European  CE or USFDA 

certificate not submitted.

Non Responsive

Emco Tech Equipments Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Harrak International Responsive Responsive Responsive

N.W. Overseas Responsive Responsive Responsive

Emco Tech Equipments Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Harrak International Responsive Responsive Responsive

N.W. Overseas Responsive Responsive Responsive

Biomedix Optotechnik & Devices Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Rohit Surgical Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Non Responsive Air cooling  instead of thermo 

electric cooling.

Non Responsive

Appasamy Associates Responsive Non Responsive Valid European  CE or USFDA 

certificate not submitted.

Non Responsive

Emco Tech Equipments Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

N.W. Overseas Non Responsive Performance criteria 

not complies for 

Authorized Agent even 

after clarification.

Responsive Non Responsive

Biomedix Optotechnik & Devices Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

11 Fully automated Elisa 

Processor

Bioscreen Instruments Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

DHR Holding India Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Rattan Sales Corporation Responsive Non Responsive Valid European  CE or USFDA 

certificate not submitted.

Non Responsive

BR Biomedicals Pvt. Ltd. Non Responsive BG Validity short by 4 

days

Not evaluated As Bid is preliminary non 

responsive hence technically 

the bid is not evaluated

Non Responsive

Labcon Scientific Instruments (P) Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

12 Cryostat

8 Phaco Emulsification 

System

9 Endolaser with laser 

Indirect Ophthalmoscope

10 Non-contact Optical 

Biometer

7 Corneal Topography



13 Automatic Blood 

component Separation 

system

14 Automatic Immuno 

Histochemistry Stainer

15 Mobile C-Arm image 

intensifier with DSA

16 Computed Rdiography 

system

DHR Holding India Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Rattan Sales Corporation Responsive Non Responsive Valid European  CE or USFDA 

certificate not submitted.

Non Responsive

Labcon Scientific Instruments (P) Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

BR Biomedicals Pvt. Ltd. Non Responsive BG Validity short by 4 

days

Not evaluated As Bid is preliminary non 

responsive hence technically 

the bid is not evaluated

Non Responsive

DHR Holding India Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Tissue basket base diameter is 

equal to neck diameter in place 

of less diameter of base.

Responsive

BR Biomedicals Pvt. Ltd. Non Responsive BG Validity short by 4 

days

Not evaluated As Bid is preliminary non 

responsive hence technically 

the bid is not evaluated

Non Responsive

Labcon Scientific Instruments (P) Ltd. Responsive Responsive Inbuilt vacuum and metal 

reagent containers with beaker 

carriers not available.

Responsive

19 Multiparameter 

Anaesthesia Monitor

DHR Holding India Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Non Responsive Valid European  CE or USFDA 

certificate not submitted.

Non Responsive

Quality Scientific & Mechanical Works Non Responsive Performance criteria 

not complies even 

after submission of 

clarification.

Non Responsive Valid European  CE or USFDA 

certificate not submitted.

Non Responsive

Radical Instruments Responsive Non Responsive Valid European  CE or USFDA 

certificate not submitted.

Non Responsive

Towa Optics (India) Pvt. Ltd. Non Responsive BG Validity short by 4 

days

Not evaluated As Bid is preliminary non 

responsive hence technically 

the bid is not evaluated

Non Responsive

DHR Holding India Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive21 Tissue Embedding System

17 Rotary Microtome   

18 Automatic Tissue 

Processor

No Bid Received

20 Penta Head Teaching cum 

Research Microscope

No Bid Received

Item Deleted

Item Deleted

Item Deleted



Rattan Sales Corporation Responsive Non Responsive Valid European  CE or USFDA 

certificate not submitted.

Non Responsive

Labcon Scientific Instruments (P) Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Medion Healthcare Pvt. Ltd. Non Responsive Manufacturer's 

Authorization form 

submitted is unsigned

Responsive Non Responsive

Schiller Healthcare India Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

Maquet Medcial India Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Responsive Responsive

VBM India Co. Non Responsive Performance criteria 

not complies even 

after submission of 

clarification.

Non Responsive Valid European  CE or USFDA 

certificate not submitted for 

the quoted model.

Non Responsive

Covidien Healthcare India Pvt Ltd Responsive Responsive Responsive

Air Liquide Medcial Systems Pvt. Ltd. Responsive Non Responsive Valid European  CE or USFDA 

certificate not submitted.

Non Responsive

Wipro GE Haelthcare Responsive Responsive Responsive

Rohanika Electronics & Medcail Systems Responsive Responsive Responsive

N.W. Overseas Non Responsive BG short on amount 

by Rs. 80,000

Not evaluated As Bid is preliminary non 

responsive hence technically 

the bid is not evaluated

Non Responsive

21 Tissue Embedding System

22 ICU Ventilators


